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Federation (PEF). These employees are not 
members of the SUNY Cortland Faculty.  
 
  
Consult with Faculty: The phrase "consult 
with the faculty" shall be interpreted as 
follows:  
 
To meet with the Faculty Senate, or with 
that portion of the faculty directly 
concerned with the matter under 
consideration, for the purpose of 
determining what the will of the faculty may 
be. With the approval of the Senate, the 
opinions of the faculty may be solicited by 
means other than by a meeting. Meetings 
for consultation shall be held only after 
proper notice of time, place, and agenda 
has been given to all persons concerned. 
Votes may be taken by secret ballot. 
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Consult with Faculty: The phrase "consult 
with the faculty" shall be interpreted as 
follows:  
 
To meet with the Faculty Senate, or with 
that portion of the faculty directly 
concerned with the matter under 
consideration, for the purpose of 
determining what the will of the faculty may 
be. With the approval of the Senate, the 
opinions of the faculty may be solicited by 
means other than by a meeting. Meetings 
for consultation shall be held only after 
proper notice of time, place, and agenda 
has been given to all persons concerned. 
Votes may be taken by secret ballot. 

Section 150.03 Chair and Presiding OƯicer of the Faculty 
Current Recommendations New 

Section 150.02  
 
The president of theௗuniversity is the chair 
of the faculty. The faculty elects a presiding 
oƯicer as specified by the constitution and 
bylaws of the faculty. (BOT Policies: Article 
X, Section 2) 

Section 150.03 
 
The SUNY Cortland President shall be the 
chair of the SUNY Cortland faculty.  of each 
college. The Faculty elects a presiding 
oƯicer to serve as Chair of the Faculty 
Senate according to the process 
prescribed in Section 150.04 Article IX. 
Each college faculty may provide for the 
selection of its presiding oƯicer, in a 
manner to be specified in college faculty 
bylaws. Both the Chancellor and the chief 

Section 150.03 
 
The SUNY Cortland President shall be the 
chair of the SUNY Cortland faculty. The 
Faculty elects a presiding oƯicer to serve 
as Chair of the Faculty Senate according to 
the process prescribed in Section 150.04 
Article IX. Both the Chancellor and the 
chief administrative oƯicer shall be 
empowered to call meetings of the college 
faculty or the governance body of that 
faculty and of its executive committee. The 
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administrative oƯicer shall be empowered 
to call meetings of the college faculty or the 
governance body of that faculty and of its 
executive committee. The agendum of 
each meeting of these bodies shall provide, 
as a priority order of business, an 
opportunity for both the Chancellor and the 
chief administrative oƯicer to present their 
reports. The president of the university is 
the chair of the faculty. The faculty elects a 
presiding oƯicer as specified by the 
constitution and bylaws of the faculty. (BOT 
Policies: Article X, Section 2) 
 
 

agendum of each meeting of these bodies 
shall provide, as a priority order of 
business, an opportunity for both the 
Chancellor and the chief administrative 
oƯicer to present their reports. (BOT 
Policies: Article X, Section 2) 
 

Section 150.04 SUNY Cortland Faculty Bylaws 
Current Recommendations New 

These bylaws define the role of the faculty 
in the governance of the university, in 
accordance with the legal requirements of 
the State University of New York, 
the Policies of the Board of Trustees of the 
State University of New York, and the local 
College Council. They identify faculty 
responsibilities and obligations within the 
administrative and academic structures of 
the university, and provide an process 
through which consultation with faculty 
and shared governance is ensured. within 
which the ideals of academic freedom, 
intellectual honesty, and social justice and 
shared governance is ensured. 

These bylaws define the role of the faculty 
in the governance of the university, in 
accordance with the legal requirements of 
the State University of New York, 
the Policies of the Board of Trustees of the 
State University of New York, and the local 
College Council. They These bylaws 
identify faculty responsibilities and 
obligations within the administrative and 
academic structures of the University and 
provide a process through which 
consultation with faculty and shared 
governance is ensured.  within which the 
ideals of academic freedom, intellectual 
honesty, and social justice and shared 
governance is ensured.  may be pursued. 

These bylaws identify faculty 
responsibilities and obligations within the 
administrative and academic structures of 
the University and provide a process 
through which consultation with faculty 
and shared governance is ensured. 

150.04 Article I Name 


